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Item Document 

1. Draft Agenda – to adopt SC-79/18 

2. Report on the meeting of 26 September 2017 – to consider and, 
if appropriate, to approve 

SC-78/17 

3. Compliance with Statistical Rules – to note 
 

The Chief of the Statistics Section will report on compliance with 
the Rules on Statistics. 

SC-80/18 

4. Changes to the Rules on Statistics: Certificates of Origin – to 
consider and, if appropriate, to recommend for approval 

 
Members will be invited to consider a proposal to amend the Rules 
on Certificates of Origin. 

SC-81/18 

5. Improving ICO data quality – to note  

5.1 An analysis of ICO data and the results of the ICO survey 
 

The Chief of the Statistics Section will present an analysis of the 
quality of ICO data and the results of the ICO survey on statistical 
variables. 

SC-82/18 

5.2 Statistics Roundtable 
 

Members will be invited to note the outcomes of the Statistics 
Roundtable events held in coffee year 2017/18. 

verbal 
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6. Collecting data on production – to note verbal 

6.1 Technoserve 
 
Mr Paul Stewart, Global Coffee Director at Technoserve will give a 
presentation on enhancing the collection of data on production 
costs. 

 

6.2 PROMECAFE 
 
Mr René León-Gómez, Secretary of PROMECAFE, will present a 
study on production costs. 

 

6.3 World Coffee Research 
 
Mr Christophe Montagnon, Scientific Director, World Coffee 
Research will give a presentation on the Global Coffee Monitoring 
Program. 

 

6.4 Intelligentsia Coffee, Inc. 
 

Mr Michael Sheridan, Director of Sourcing and Shared Value - 
Intelligentsia Coffee, Inc. will give a presentation on the costs of 
the production chain. 

 

7. ICO Award for Excellence in Coffee-Related Research – to 
consider and, if appropriate, to recommend for approval 

 
Members will be invited to consider a concept note on the 
creation of an International Coffee Organization Award for Coffee-
Related Research, and if appropriate, to recommend for approval 
to Council. 

SC-83/18 

8. Other business – to consider  verbal 

9. Date of next meeting – to note 
 

Members are invited to suggest matters for consideration at the 
next meeting. 
 
The next meeting will take place in London, United Kingdom, at 
the time of the 122nd Council Session from 17 to 21 September 
2018. 

verbal 
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REFERENCE DOCUMENTS 

Rules on Statistics – Certificates of Origin (ICC-102-9) 

Rules on Statistics – Statistical Reports (ICC-102-10)  

Rules on Statistics – Indicator Prices (ICC-105-17)  
 ICC-105-17 Add. 3 (Share of markets and their weightings in the calculation of group and 

composite prices from 1 October 2015) 

Terms of reference for the Statistics Committee (ICC-115-13 (Annex VI)) 

List of exporting countries and their country codes, ICO Certifying Agents and registered ports of 
export (ICC-106-3) 

 
 

http://www.ico.org/documents/icc-102-9e-rules-certificates-final.pdf
http://www.ico.org/documents/icc-102-10e-rules-statistical-reports-final.pdf
http://www.ico.org/documents/icc-105-17e-rules-indicator-prices-final.pdf
http://www.ico.org/documents/cy2016-17/icc-105-17-a3e-rules-indicator-prices-final.pdf
http://www.ico.org/documents/cy2016-17/icc-105-17-a3e-rules-indicator-prices-final.pdf
http://www.ico.org/documents/cy2014-15/icc-115-13e-tor-committees.pdf
http://www.ico.org/documents/icc-106-3e-ports.pdf
http://www.ico.org/documents/icc-106-3e-ports.pdf
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